
Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 1 - DUCTILE IRON PIPE

16" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 20  LF               944.00             988.00  $        876.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        910.00         1,013.00 

12" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 20  LF               652.00             682.00  $        605.60  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        628.80            701.00 

10" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 20  LF               516.00             540.00  $        480.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        498.60            556.00 

8" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 20  LF               395.60             414.00  $        366.66  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        381.40            424.00 

6" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 60  LF               838.80             879.00  $        778.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        808.80            302.00 

4" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 60  LF            1,168.80          1,224.00  $     1,084.20  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $     1,126.80            424.00 

Total Item 1 - DUCTILE IRON PIPE  $        4,515.20  $      4,727.00  $     4,192.06  $                -    $                -    $                  -    $     4,354.40  $     3,420.00 

ITEM 2 - PVC PIPE

12" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 20  LF               290.00             475.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            290.40            308.00 

10" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 20  LF               207.00             335.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            205.80            218.00 

8" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 20  LF               135.60             225.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            137.40            146.00 

6" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 60  LF               238.80             390.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid              79.20            252.00 

4" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 60  LF               121.20             195.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid              40.20            132.00 

Total Item 2 - PVC PIPE  $           992.60  $      1,620.00  $                -    $                -    $                -    $                  -    $        753.00  $     1,056.00 

ITEM 3 - PE TUBING

2" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 200  LF               308.00  $         280.00  No Bid  No Bid            232.00  No Bid            322.00            290.00 

1 1/2" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 100  LF                 90.00  $           80.00  No Bid  No Bid              65.00  No Bid              93.00            186.00 

1 1/4" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 60  LF                 46.80  $           36.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid              37.20              39.00 

1" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 1000  LF               390.00  $         400.00  No Bid  No Bid            390.00  No Bid            440.00            390.00 

3/4" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 300  LF                 82.50  $           75.00  No Bid  No Bid              69.00  No Bid              84.00              84.00 

Total Item 3 - PE TUBING  $           917.30  $         871.00  $                -    $                -    $        756.00  $                  -    $        976.20  $        989.00 



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 4 - MJ VALVES

12" MJ GATE VALVE 1  EA            1,640.00          1,434.00  $     1,432.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $     1,484.44         1,440.00 

10" MJ GATE VALVE 1  EA            1,295.00          1,140.00  $     1,132.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $     1,182.73         1,135.00 

8" GATE VALVE 1  EA               830.00             730.00  $        725.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        763.50            730.00 

6" MJ GATE VALVE 4  EA            2,040.00          1,836.00  $     1,820.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        489.17         1,840.00 

4" MJ GATE VALVE 1  EA               410.00             360.00  $        357.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        385.13            360.00 

Total Item 4 - MJ VALVES  $        6,215.00  $      5,500.00  $     5,466.00  $                -    $                -    $                  -    $     4,304.97  $     5,505.00 

ITEM 5 - MJ FITTINGS (BENDS,SOLID SLEEVES, ETC)

Solid Sleeves

12" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 1  EA               230.00             227.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        218.45            224.00 

10" MJ  SOLID SLEEVE 1  EA               170.00             168.25  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        161.89            165.00 

8" MJ  SOLID SLEEVE 1  EA               115.00             112.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        107.93            110.00 

6" MJ  SOLID SLEEVE 2  EA               176.00             171.60  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        165.14            170.00 

4" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2  EA               106.00             114.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        110.52            114.00 

 $           797.00  $         793.65  $                -    $                -    $                -    $                  -    $        763.93  $        783.00 Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Solid Sleeves



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
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Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 5 - MJ FITTINGS (BENDS,SOLID SLEEVES, ETC) CONTINUED

Bends

12" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 1  EA               370.00             362.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        349.13            360.00 

10" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 1  EA               255.00             250.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        240.56            245.00 

8" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 1  EA               147.00             144.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        138.48            140.00 

6" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 1  EA               100.00               98.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          94.27              96.00 

4" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 1  EA                 64.00               62.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          59.81              62.00 

16" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 1  EA               649.00             635.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        608.97            630.00 

12" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 1  EA               294.00             288.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        275.69            285.00 

10" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 1  EA               169.00             165.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        158.55            165.00 

8" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 1  EA               117.00             114.75  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        110.02            115.00 

6" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 1  EA                 83.00               81.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          77.66              80.00 

4" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 1  EA                 53.00               52.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          49.83              51.00 

16" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 1  EA               623.00             610.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        586.48            605.00 

12" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 1  EA               249.00             244.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        234.46            241.00 

10" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 1  EA               164.00             160.75  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        154.58            160.00 

8" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 1  EA               114.00             112.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        107.81            110.00 

6" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 1  EA                 75.00               73.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          70.79              74.00 

4" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 1  EA                 51.00               50.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          48.06              49.00 

16" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 1  EA               658.00             610.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        587.70            605.00 

12" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 1  EA               235.00             231.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        222.58            230.00 

8" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 1  EA               104.00             102.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          98.93            102.00 

6" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 1  EA                 77.00               75.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          72.89              74.00 

4" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 1  EA                 45.00               44.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          42.95              44.00 

4,696.00$        4,565.50$      -$              -$               -$              -$                 4,390.20$     4,523.00$     Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Bends



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 5 - MJ FITTINGS (BENDS,SOLID SLEEVES, ETC) CONTINUED

Reducers

12" X 8" MJ REDUCER 1  EA               188.00             184.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        177.31            182.00 

12" X 6" MJ REDUCER 1  EA               184.00             180.40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        173.41            178.00 

12" X 4" MJ REDUCER 1  EA               192.00             188.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        181.21            180.00 

8" X 6" MJ REDUCER 1  EA                 96.00               94.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          90.93              94.00 

8" X 4" MJ REDUCER 1  EA                 90.00               88.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          84.43              86.00 

6" X 4" MJ REDUCER 1  EA                 58.00               56.75  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          54.56              56.00 

 $           808.00  $         792.65  $                -    $                -    $                -    $                  -    $        761.85  $        776.00 

Tees

12" X 12" X 12" MJ TEE 1  EA               476.00             465.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        445.85            460.00 

12" X 12" X 10" MJ TEE 1  EA               454.00             445.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        425.82            420.00 

12" X 12" X 8" MJ TEE 1  EA               360.00             353.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        337.94            350.00 

12" X 12" X 6" MJ TEE 1  EA               340.00             334.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        319.85            340.00 

12" X 12" X 6" MJ SWIVEL TEE 1  EA               380.00             372.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        356.03            370.00 

10" X 10" X 6" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1  EA               327.00             320.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        303.92            320.00 

8" X 8" X 8" MJ TEE 1  EA               215.00             211.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        202.25            210.00 

8" X 8" X 6" MJ TEE 1  EA               181.00             177.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        169.94            175.00 

8" X 8" X 4" MJ TEE 1  EA               150.00             146.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        140.22            145.00 

8" X 6" SWIVEL TEE 1  EA               208.00             204.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        195.14            200.00 

6" X 6" X 6" MJ TEE 1  EA               145.00             141.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        135.69            140.00 

6" X 6" X 4" MJ TEE 1  EA               129.00             127.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        121.48            125.00 

6" X 6" MJ SWIVEL TEE 1  EA               167.00             163.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        156.37            160.00 

4" MJ TEE 1  EA                 85.00               83.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          79.48              82.00 

 $        3,617.00  $      3,541.00  $                -    $                -    $                -    $                  -    $     3,389.98  $     3,497.00 

Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Reducers

Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Tees



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 
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Hoadley and 
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Winwater 
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Company, 
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ITEM 5 - MJ FITTINGS (BENDS,SOLID SLEEVES, ETC) CONTINUED

Plugs

12" MJ PLUG 1  EA               130.00             129.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        121.01            130.00 

8" MJ PLUG 1  EA                 85.00               83.75  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          83.11              83.00 

6" MJ PLUG 1  EA                 60.00               58.75  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          58.31              58.00 

4" MJ PLUG 1  EA                 38.00               37.25  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          36.86              37.00 

Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Reducers  $           313.00  $         308.75  $                -    $                -    $                -    $                  -    $        299.29  $        308.00 

Caps

12" MJ CAP 1               117.00             114.75  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        113.94            114.00 

8" MJ CAP 1                 62.00               61.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          60.99              60.00 

6" MJ CAP 1                 40.00               39.20  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          38.87              40.00 

4" MJ CAP 1                 30.00               29.05  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          28.82              29.00 

Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Reducers  $           249.00  $         244.50  $                -    $                -    $                -    $                  -    $        242.62  $        243.00 

Total Item 5 - MJ FITTINGS  $      10,480.00  $    10,246.05  $                -    $                -    $                -    $                  -    $     9,847.87  $   10,130.00 



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
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ITEM 6 - RETAINER GLANDS

12" MEGA-LUG MJ  WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 3  EA               282.00             265.50  No Bid  $         268.35  No Bid  No Bid  $        263.01            238.50 

10" MEGA-LUG MJ  WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 3  EA               210.00             198.00  No Bid  $         193.05  No Bid  No Bid  $        197.31            178.20 

8" MEGA-LUG MJ  WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 6  EA               288.00             277.50  No Bid  $         266.70  No Bid  No Bid  $        275.76            249.60 

6" MEGA-LUG MJ  WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 6  EA               216.00             204.00  No Bid  $         188.10  No Bid  No Bid  $        204.78            183.60 

4" MEGA-LUG MJ  WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 3  EA                 87.00               82.20  No Bid  $           78.75  No Bid  No Bid  $          85.68              73.80 

12" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 3  EA               306.00  No Bid  No Bid  $         298.35  No Bid  No Bid  $        293.70            262.80 

10" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 3  EA               294.00  No Bid  No Bid  $         282.00  No Bid  No Bid  $        278.76            249.30 

8" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 6  EA               336.00  No Bid  No Bid  $         314.40  No Bid  No Bid  $        322.08            289.20 

6" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 6  EA               252.00  No Bid  No Bid  $         225.00  No Bid  No Bid  $        239.82            214.20 

4" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 3  EA                 99.00  No Bid  No Bid  $           92.10  No Bid  No Bid  $          98.67              84.90 

 $        2,370.00  $      1,027.20  $                -    $      2,206.80  $                -    $                  -    $     2,259.57  $     2,024.10 

ITEM 7 - GATE BOXES AND RISERS

GATE BOX COVER 60  EA               960.00             735.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            723.60  No Bid 

LOCKING GATE BOX COVER 10  EA               408.50             215.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            286.40  No Bid 

GATE BOX COMPLETE, 48" BOTTOM, 26" TOP W/COVER 25  EA            4,187.50          3,100.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         3,070.25  No Bid 

GATE BOX TOP, 26" W/ COVER 20  EA            1,620.00          1,170.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         1,151.60  No Bid 

GATE BOX BOTTOM, 48" 20  EA            2,060.00          1,310.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         1,308.80  No Bid 

GATE BOX RISER, 1" 60  EA            1,194.00             261.00  No Bid  No Bid  $        255.00  No Bid            262.20  No Bid 

GATE BOX RISER, 1 1/2" 60  EA            1,440.00             360.00  No Bid  No Bid  $        340.20  No Bid            345.00  No Bid 

GATE BOX RISER, 2" 30  EA               810.00             222.00  No Bid  No Bid  $        209.40  No Bid            217.20  No Bid 

GATE BOX RISER, 4" 10  EA               419.00             149.00  No Bid  No Bid  $        145.00  No Bid            144.80  No Bid 

GATE BOX RISER, 12" ADJUSTABLE (Rise Rite style) 6  EA  No Bid               96.90  No Bid  No Bid  $          98.10  No Bid              89.64  No Bid 

GATE BOX RISER, 18" ADJUSTABLE (Rise Rite style) 6  EA  No Bid             138.00  No Bid  No Bid  $        143.88  No Bid            134.46  No Bid 

 $      13,099.00  $      7,756.90  $                -    $                -    $     1,191.58  $                  -    $     7,733.95  $                -   

Total Item 6 - RETAINER GLANDS

Total Item 7 - GATE BOXES AND RISERS
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ITEM 8 - SERVICE SADDLES

12" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           89.50              90.00  No Bid              81.39                 93.97              95.02  No Bid 

12" X 1.5" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           79.75              80.00  No Bid              81.39                 93.97              95.02  No Bid 

12"X 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 2  EA  No Bid  $         156.50            158.00  No Bid            151.28               207.54            112.86  No Bid 

12"X 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           78.25              79.00  No Bid              75.64                 83.49              56.43  No Bid 

10" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE-STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           74.25              75.00  No Bid              78.10                 87.37              88.35  No Bid 

10" X 1.5" CC SERVICE SADDLE-STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           68.75              69.00  No Bid              78.10                 87.37              88.35  No Bid 

10" x 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           64.00              65.00  No Bid              69.63                 80.26              48.79  No Bid 

10" x 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           64.00              64.00  No Bid              69.63                 80.26              48.79  No Bid 

8" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           62.75              63.00  No Bid              64.95                 71.49              52.27  No Bid 

8" X 1.5" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           60.25              61.00  No Bid              64.95                 71.49              52.27  No Bid 

8" X 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 6  EA  No Bid  $         339.00            342.00  No Bid            343.92               398.82            274.44  No Bid 

8" X 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 2  EA  No Bid  $         113.00            114.00  No Bid            114.64               132.94              91.48  No Bid 

6" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           57.25              58.00  No Bid              53.48                 62.57              63.27  No Bid 

6" X 1 1/2" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           49.50              50.00  No Bid              53.48                 62.57              63.27  No Bid 

6" X 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 10  EA  No Bid  $         477.50            480.00  No Bid            474.80               579.80            408.80  No Bid 

6" X 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 2  EA  No Bid  $           95.50              96.00  No Bid              94.96               115.96              81.76  No Bid 

4" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE- STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           47.75              48.00  No Bid              49.47                 55.19              48.52  No Bid 

4" X 1 1/2" CC SERVICE SADDLE- STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           43.25              43.00  No Bid              49.47                 55.19              48.52  No Bid 

4" X 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE- STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 3  EA  No Bid  $         127.50            129.00  No Bid            125.91               149.82            117.45  No Bid 

4" X 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE- STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           42.50              43.00  No Bid              41.97                 49.94              39.15  No Bid 

2" X 1" IP SERVICE SADDLE WITH STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           38.50              39.00  No Bid              37.94                 44.82              34.78  No Bid 

2" X 3/4" IP SERVICE SADDLE WITH STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1  EA  No Bid  $           38.50              39.00  No Bid              37.94                 44.82              34.78  No Bid 

 $                  -    $      2,267.75  $     2,285.00  $                -    $     2,293.04  $        2,709.65  $     2,044.37  $                -   Total Item 8 - SERVICE SADDLES



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 9 - REPAIR COUPLINGS

16" REPAIR COUPLING - HYMAX 1  EA               920.00             843.00  No Bid  No Bid            862.95  No Bid            822.76            820.00 

12" DUCTILE IRON REPAIR COUPLINGS - HYMAX 2  EA               690.00             628.00  No Bid  No Bid            642.48  No Bid            747.50            750.00 

12" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY 

COATED/EXTENDED RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 2  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            784.00  No Bid            747.50            420.00 

10" DUCTILE IRON REPAIR COUPLINGS - HYMAX 2  EA               580.00             530.00  No Bid  No Bid            544.32  No Bid            559.70            570.00 

10" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY 

COATED/EXTENDED RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 2  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            587.04  No Bid            559.70            348.00 

8" DUCTILE IRON COUPLING - HYMAX 4  EA               900.00             820.00  No Bid  No Bid            846.24  No Bid            806.84            804.00 

8" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY COATED/EXTENDED 

RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            806.84            560.00 

6" DUCTILE IRON COUPLING - HYMAX 4  EA               792.00             732.00  No Bid  No Bid            749.56  No Bid            714.64            700.00 

6" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY COATED/EXTENDED 

RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            714.64            460.00 

4" DUCTILE IRON COUPLING - HYMAX 2  EA               300.00             276.00  No Bid  No Bid            282.98  No Bid            269.80            268.00 

4" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY COATED/EXTENDED 

RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 2  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            269.80            250.00 

 $        4,182.00  $      3,829.00  $                -    $                -    $     5,299.57  $                  -    $     7,019.72  $     5,950.00 Total Item 9 - REPAIR COUPLINGS



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 10 - WRAP-AROUND REPAIR CLAMPS

16" STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP DOUBLE BAND 12.5" 

LONG 1  EA  No Bid  $         317.00  No Bid  No Bid            244.29               269.28            240.63  No Bid 

16" STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP DOUBLE BAND 15" 

LONG 1  EA  No Bid  $         314.00  No Bid  No Bid            271.72               299.52            267.65  No Bid 

12" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 1  EA  No Bid  $         164.00  No Bid  No Bid            133.28               149.70            133.77  No Bid 

12" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 1  EA  No Bid  $         186.00  No Bid  No Bid            153.52               169.23            151.22  No Bid 

10" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 1  EA  No Bid  $         136.00  No Bid  No Bid            117.26               129.25            115.50  No Bid 

10" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 1  EA  No Bid  $         157.00  No Bid  No Bid            134.92               148.73            132.90  No Bid 

8" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 4  EA  No Bid  $         424.00  No Bid  No Bid            347.72               383.32            342.52  No Bid 

8" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 4  EA  No Bid  $         488.00  No Bid  No Bid            397.48               438.16            391.52  No Bid 

6" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 4  EA  No Bid  $         501.00  No Bid  No Bid            295.72               325.96            291.28  No Bid 

6" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 4  EA  No Bid  $         551.00  No Bid  No Bid            327.08               360.56            322.16  No Bid 

4" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 2  EA  No Bid  $         150.00  No Bid  No Bid            123.02               135.60            121.18  No Bid 

4" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 2  EA  No Bid             166.00  No Bid  No Bid            133.80               147.48            131.78  No Bid 

 $                  -    $      3,554.00  $                -    $                -    $     2,679.81  $        2,956.79  $     2,642.11  $                -   Total Item 10 - WRAP-AROUND REPAIR CLAMPS



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 11 - WRAP-AROUND REPAIR CLAMPS WITH TAP

12" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $         210.00  No Bid  No Bid            187.77               206.98            167.50  No Bid 

12" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $         197.00  No Bid  No Bid            174.91               192.80            172.29  No Bid 

10" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $         182.00  No Bid  No Bid            169.17               186.48            166.64  No Bid 

10" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $         169.00  No Bid  No Bid            156.32               172.31            153.98  No Bid 

8" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $         148.00  No Bid  No Bid            133.62               147.29            131.62  No Bid 

8" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $         136.00  No Bid  No Bid            120.77               133.11            118.95  No Bid 

6" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $         271.00  No Bid  No Bid            116.01               127.89            114.28  No Bid 

6" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $         253.00  No Bid  No Bid            103.15               113.71            101.61  No Bid 

4" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $         111.00  No Bid  No Bid            101.14               111.49              99.63  No Bid 

4" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1" 

CC TAP 1  EA  No Bid  $           98.50  No Bid  No Bid              88.29                 97.33              86.97  No Bid 

Total Item 11 - WRAP-AROUND REPAIR CLAMPS WITH TAP -$                 1,775.50$      -$              -$               1,351.15$     1,489.39$        1,313.47$     -$              

ITEM 12 - CORPORATION STOPS (Ball Corp, Quick Joint, no lead)

2" CORPORATION, CC X CTQJ 2  EA  No Bid  $         375.00  $        418.00             383.20            343.82               384.56            371.12            344.00 

1 1/2" CORPORATION, CC X CTQJ 2  EA  No Bid  $         226.70  $        252.00             231.72            207.90               232.52            224.40            208.00 

1" CORPORATION, CC X CTQJ 24  EA  No Bid  $      1,204.80  $     1,320.00          1,231.92         1,113.12            1,245.12         1,193.28         1,104.00 

3/4" CORPORATION, CC X CTQJ 24  EA  No Bid  $         915.60  $     1,008.00             936.48            846.48               946.80            906.96            840.00 

 $                  -    $      2,722.10  $     2,998.00  $      2,783.32  $     2,511.32  $        2,809.00  $     2,695.76  $     2,496.00 Total Item 12 - CORPORATION STOPS



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 13 - CURB STOPS (Ball Curb, Quick Joint, no lead)

2" CURB STOP, FIP X FIP 2  EA  No Bid  $         394.00  $        456.00             450.80            349.24               359.72            389.90            350.00 

2" CURB STOP, CTQJ X CTQJ 2  EA  No Bid  $         550.00  $        614.00             568.50            488.30               503.00            545.06            488.00 

1 1/2" BALL CURB VALVE, CTQJ X CTQJ 2  EA  No Bid  $         370.00  $        412.00             384.10            347.36               357.78            366.28            348.00 

1 1/2" BALL CURB VALVE, FIP X FIP 2  EA  No Bid  $         269.00  $        396.00             281.02            238.78               245.98            266.44            238.00 

1" BALL CURB VALVE, CTQJ X CTQJ 24  EA  No Bid  $      1,950.00  $     2,160.00          2,192.40         1,741.92            1,794.00         1,631.76         1,728.00 

1" BALL CURB VALVE, FIP X FIP 6  EA  No Bid  $         391.50  $        576.00             456.00            349.86               360.36            387.48            348.00 

3/4" BALL CURB VALVE, CTQJ X CTQJ 24  EA  No Bid  $      1,296.00  $     1,440.00          1,326.00         1,158.72            1,193.04         1,284.96         1,152.00 

3/4" BALL CURB VALVE, FIP X FIP 6  EA  No Bid  $         252.00  $        480.00             273.42            225.12               231.78            244.62            222.00 

 $                  -    $      5,472.50  $     6,534.00  $      5,932.24  $     4,899.30  $        5,045.66  $     5,116.50  $     4,874.00 

ITEM 14 - MALE ADAPTERS (Quick Joint, no lead)

2" CTQJ X MIP 4  EA  No Bid  $         230.00  $        244.00             235.40            206.64               212.84            237.88            204.00 

1 1/2" CTQJ X MIP 2  EA  No Bid  $           79.00  $          84.00               80.80              70.92                 73.02              81.64              72.00 

1" CTQJ X MIP 10  EA  No Bid  $         142.50  $        150.00             146.00            129.50               133.20            147.60            130.00 

1" CTQJ X 3/4" MIP 6  EA  No Bid  $           75.00  $          84.00               76.80              72.60                 74.76              77.52              75.00 

3/4" CTQJ X 1" MIP 6  EA  No Bid  $           78.00  $          84.00               80.87              71.64                 73.74              81.60              72.00 

3/4" CTQJ X MIP 10  EA  No Bid  $         120.00  $        130.00             124.00            109.30               112.50            124.90            105.00 

 $                  -    $         724.50  $        776.00  $         743.87  $        660.60  $           680.06  $        751.14  $        658.00 

ITEM 15 - FEMALE ADAPTERS (Quick Joint, no lead)

2" CTQJ X FIP 4  EA  No Bid  $         241.00  $        268.00             246.20            216.04               222.44            248.80            216.00 

1 1/2" CTQJ X FIP 4  EA  No Bid  $         202.00  $        224.00             206.60            181.40               186.84            208.80            180.00 

1" CTQJ X FIP 10  EA  No Bid  $         185.00  $        200.00             189.50            156.00               160.60            191.40            155.00 

1" CTQJ X 3/4" FIP 6  EA  No Bid  $           90.00  $        101.64               97.20              81.24                 80.64              92.94              73.20 

3/4" CTQJ X 1" FIP 6  EA  No Bid  $           90.00  $        101.64               93.00              82.08                 84.54              93.90              72.60 

3/4" CTQJ X FIP 10  EA  No Bid  $         129.50  $        145.00             132.50            115.00               118.30            133.80            115.00 

 $                  -    $         937.50  $     1,040.28  $         965.00  $        831.76  $           853.36  $        969.64  $        811.80 

Total Item 13 - CURB STOPS

Total Item 14 - MALE ADAPTERS

Total Item 15 - FEMALE ADAPTERS



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 16 - 3 PART UNIONS (Quick Joint, no lead)

2" CTQJ BRASS UNION CTQJ X CTQJ 4  EA  No Bid  $         306.00  $        342.00  No Bid            275.08               283.32            316.80            272.00 

1 1/2" 3 PART UNION CTQJ X CTQJ 4  EA  No Bid  $         226.00  $        252.00  No Bid            203.76               209.84            234.56            204.00 

1" 3 PART UNION CTQJ X CTQJ 10  EA  No Bid  $         160.00  $        180.00  No Bid            152.30               156.80            166.40            152.50 

1" CTQJ X 3/4" CTQJ 10  EA  No Bid  $         162.00  $        182.00  No Bid            154.70               159.20            168.10            155.00 

3/4" 3 PART UNION CTQJ X CTQJ 10  EA  No Bid  $         147.50  $        165.00  No Bid            133.10               137.00            152.40            134.00 

 $                  -    $      1,001.50  $     1,121.00  $                -    $        918.94  $           946.16  $     1,038.26  $        917.50 

ITEM 17 - COMPRESSION BENDS (Quick Joint, no lead)

1" 90 DEG. BEND CTQJ X CTQJ 6  EA  No Bid  $         139.50  $        156.00  No Bid            132.54               136.50            144.30            133.20 

3/4" 90 DEG. BEND CTQJ X CTQJ 6  EA  No Bid  $         108.00  $        120.00  No Bid            103.20               106.26            112.44            104.40 

 $                  -    $         247.50  $        276.00  $                -    $        235.74  $           242.76  $        256.74  $        237.60 

ITEM 18 - CURB BOXES 

BUFFALO STYLE CURB BOX WITH COVER(48" bottom, 24" top) 60  EA  No Bid          3,441.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            3,726.00         4,414.20  No Bid 

BUFFALO STYLE CURB BOX EXTENSION 9" 30  EA  No Bid             439.50  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               511.80            524.70  No Bid 

BUFFALO STYLE CURB BOX EXTENSION 16" 16  EA  No Bid             265.60  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               309.76            317.60  No Bid 

BUFFALO STYLE CURB BOX COVER 12  EA  No Bid               46.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid                 54.24              55.56  No Bid 

12" CENTERING ROD FOR BUFFALO STYLE BOX 100  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            2,102.00            385.00  No Bid 

 $                  -    $      4,192.90  $                -    $                -    $                -    $        6,703.80  $     5,697.06  $                -   

Total Item 16 - 3 PART UNIONS

Total Item 17 - COMPRESSION BENDS

Total Item 18 - CURB BOXES



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 19 - METER VALVES (no lead)

2" BALL VALVE, FLANGE X FIP w/handle 12  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         2,493.84            2,594.04  No Bid  No Bid 

1 1/2" BALL VALVE, FLANGE X FIP w/handle 8  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         1,065.52            1,108.32  No Bid  No Bid 

1" BALL VALVE, FIP X FIP W/ HANDLE 20  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         1,230.80            1,312.20  No Bid  No Bid 

1"  BALL VALVE WITH HANDLE, CTQJ X 3/4" meter swivel 20  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         1,151.20            1,453.40  No Bid  No Bid 

1" 90 DEGREE BALL VALVE CTQJ X 3/4" meter swivel 50  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         3,301.50            3,266.50  No Bid  No Bid 

3/4" CELLAR VALVE W/ HANDLE, FIP X FIP 10  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            422.80               423.90  No Bid  No Bid 

3/4" CELLAR VALVE W/ HANDLE, CTQJ X 3/4" meter swivel 20  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         1,070.00            1,113.20  No Bid  No Bid 

3/4" 90 DEGREE BALL VALVE CTQJ X 3/4" meter swivel 50  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         2,928.00            2,877.50  No Bid  No Bid 

3/4" FIP X 3/4" meter swivel 20  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            959.20            1,000.60  No Bid  No Bid 

 $                  -    $                -    $                -    $                -    $   14,622.86  $      15,149.66  $                -    $                -   

 ITEM 20 - METER FLANGES (No lead)

2" BRONZE METER FLANGE X 2" FIP 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            165.04               171.68  No Bid  No Bid 

1 1/2" BRONZE  METER FLANGE X 1 1/2" FIP 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            126.36               131.44  No Bid  No Bid 

METER ADAPTOR, 2" FLANGE X 1" METER NUT 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            431.56               448.88  No Bid  No Bid 

METER ADAPTOR,  1 1/2" FLANGE X 1" METER NUT 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            421.64               438.60  No Bid  No Bid 

 $                  -    $                -    $                -    $                -    $     1,144.60  $        1,190.60  $                -    $                -   

ITEM 21 - METER SET FITTINGS (No lead)

1" CHECK VALVE FIP X FIP 40  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            912.40  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1" CHECK VALVE 1" FIP x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (straight) 60  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

3/4" CHECK VALVE 3/4" FIP x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (straight) 60  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         2,758.20  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1" CHECK VALVE 1" FIP x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (90 degree) 40  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

3/4" CHECK VALVE 3/4" FIP x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (90 degree) 40  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid         1,838.80  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

1" MIP x 5/8" x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (1" METER SPUD) 40  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            284.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

3/4" MIP x 5/8" x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (3/4" METER SPUD) 40  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            284.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 $                  -    $                -    $                -    $                -    $     6,077.40  $                  -    $                -    $                -   

Total Item 19 - METER VALVES

Total Item 20 - METER FLANGES

Total Item 21 - METER SET FITTINGS



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 22 - BRASS WELL ADAPTERS (No lead)

1" MIP X 1" BARB 6  EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid              61.38                 67.92 No Bid No Bid

1" BARB X 3/4" MIP 6  EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid              52.20                 57.84 No Bid No Bid

3/4" FIP X 3/4" BARB 6  EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid              37.08                 61.92 No Bid No Bid

1" FIP X 3/4" BARB 6  EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid              58.50                 65.46 No Bid No Bid

 $                  -    $                -    $                -    $                -    $        209.16  $           253.14  $                -    $                -   Total Item 22 - BRASS WELL ADAPTERS



Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

DESCRIPTION Quantity  Unit 
 H.R. Prescott 

& Sons, Inc. 

 John 

Hoadley and 

Sons, Inc. 

 Bay State 

Water Works 

Supply, Inc. 

 Easton 

Winwater 

Works 

Supply 

Company 

 Stiles 

Company, 

Inc. 

 Ti-Sales, Inc. 
 H.D. Supply 

Waterworks 

 Putnam Pipe 

Corp. 

ITEM 23 - THREADED BRASS (DOMESTIC, no lead)

2" BRASS IP, 90 DEG. BEND 4  EA  No Bid  $         163.00  No Bid  No Bid            144.88               178.20 82.80  No Bid 

2" BRASS IP, 45 DEG. BEND 4  EA  No Bid  $         223.00  No Bid  No Bid            198.64               244.28 91.12  No Bid 

1 1/2" BRASS IP, 90 DEG. BEND 4  EA  No Bid  $         101.00  No Bid  No Bid              89.76               110.40 70.80  No Bid 

1 1/2" BRASS IP, 45 DEG. BEND 4  EA  No Bid  $         138.00  No Bid  No Bid            214.90                 54.88 56.20  No Bid 

1" BRASS IP, 90 DEG. BEND 4  EA  No Bid  $           50.00  No Bid  No Bid              44.88                 55.20 25.64  No Bid 

3/4" BRASS IP, 90 DEG. BEND 4  EA  No Bid  $           31.00  No Bid  No Bid              27.60                 33.96 16.64  No Bid 

2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           84.80  No Bid  No Bid              58.20                 92.80 79.80  No Bid 

2" X 4" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           57.40  No Bid  No Bid              39.44                 71.28 54.04  No Bid 

2" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           43.80  No Bid  No Bid              30.12                 54.48 41.32  No Bid 

2" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           35.20  No Bid  No Bid              24.20                 43.72 33.16  No Bid 

1 1/2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           66.00  No Bid  No Bid              45.28                 81.84 62.04  No Bid 

1 1/2" X 4" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           44.60  No Bid  No Bid              30.64                 51.00 42.00  No Bid 

1 1/2" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           34.00  No Bid  No Bid              23.52                 37.52 32.28  No Bid 

1 1/2" X 2" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           24.92  No Bid  No Bid              17.08                 27.28 23.44  No Bid 

1 1/2" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           23.00  No Bid  No Bid              15.88                 26.40 21.80  No Bid 

1" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           37.40  No Bid  No Bid              25.72                 41.04 35.28  No Bid 

1" X 4" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           25.40  No Bid  No Bid              17.48                 31.60 23.96  No Bid 

1" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           19.56  No Bid  No Bid              13.40                 24.28 18.36  No Bid 

1" X 2" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           14.40  No Bid  No Bid              10.00                 18.08 13.68  No Bid 

1" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           11.80  No Bid  No Bid                8.08                 14.64 11.12  No Bid 

3/4" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           25.60  No Bid  No Bid              17.60                 31.84 24.16  No Bid 

3/4" X 4" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           17.60  No Bid  No Bid              12.08                 19.24 16.52  No Bid 

3/4" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           13.40  No Bid  No Bid                9.24                 16.76 12.68  No Bid 

3/4" X 2" BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $           10.00  No Bid  No Bid                6.92                 12.52 9.48  No Bid 

3/4" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 4  EA  No Bid  $             8.00  No Bid  No Bid                5.52                   9.96 7.52  No Bid 

2" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $         167.00  No Bid  No Bid            148.40               182.52 71.36  No Bid 

2" X 1 1/2" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $         216.40  No Bid  No Bid            192.44               236.68 81.44  No Bid 
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2" X 1" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $         233.80  $        208.00  No Bid            207.84               255.64 88.80  No Bid 

2" X 3/4" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $         233.80  $        208.00  No Bid            207.84               255.64 52.20  No Bid 

1 1/2" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $         101.00  $          92.00  No Bid              89.76               110.40 43.36  No Bid 

1 1/2" X 1" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $         133.60  $        120.00  No Bid            118.80               146.12 54.80  No Bid 

1 1/2" X 3/4" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $         151.00  $        136.00  No Bid            134.32               165.20 61.68  No Bid 

1" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $           46.40  $          44.00  No Bid              41.32                 50.88 48.56  No Bid 

1" X 3/4" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $           52.68  $          47.60  No Bid              46.80                 57.60 55.00  No Bid 

3/4" BRASS COUPLING 4  EA  No Bid  $           27.20  $          24.60  No Bid              24.24                 29.84 13.44  No Bid 

2" X 1 1/2" BRASS BUSHING 4  EA  No Bid  $           85.00  $          76.16  No Bid              75.56                 92.96 43.36  No Bid 

2" X 1" BRASS BUSHING 4  EA  No Bid  $           85.00  $          76.16  No Bid              75.56                 92.96 88.80  No Bid 

2" X 3/4"" BRASS BUSHING 4  EA  No Bid  $           85.00  $          76.16  No Bid              75.56                 93.00 52.20  No Bid 

1 1/2" X 1" BRASS BUSHING 4  EA  No Bid  $           69.00  $          62.00  No Bid              61.24                 75.32 29.28  No Bid 

1 1/2" X 3/4" BRASS BUSHING 4  EA  No Bid  $           69.00  $          62.00  No Bid              61.24                 75.32 35.80  No Bid 

1" X 3/4" BRASS BUSHING 4  EA  No Bid  $           28.40  $          25.16  No Bid              25.28                 31.12 13.44  No Bid 

2" PLUG, IP 4  EA  No Bid  $           89.20  $          79.80  No Bid              79.32                 97.56 38.32  No Bid 

1 1/2" PLUG, IP 4  EA  No Bid  $           54.40  $          48.76  No Bid              48.32                 59.44 24.32  No Bid 

1 1/4" PLUG, IP 4  EA  No Bid  $           43.40  $          39.60  No Bid              38.72                 47.60 19.04  No Bid 

1" PLUG, IP 4  EA  No Bid  $           31.00  $          32.56  No Bid              27.60                 34.12 12.80  No Bid 

1" CAPS 4  EA  No Bid  $           35.20  $          31.56  No Bid              31.32                 38.52 16.80  No Bid 

1" PLUG, CC 4  EA  No Bid  $           45.40  $          32.56  No Bid              35.12                 44.64 53.64  No Bid 

3/4" PLUG, IP 4  EA  No Bid  $           19.40  $          17.60  No Bid              17.28                 21.28 9.72  No Bid 

3/4" PLUG, CC 4  EA  No Bid  $           47.96  $          21.60  No Bid              24.12                 30.64 43.40  No Bid 

2" BRASS CAP 4  EA  No Bid  $         139.80  $        124.96  No Bid            124.20               152.80 58.52  No Bid 

1 1/2" BRASS CAP 4  EA  No Bid  $           81.52  $          72.96  No Bid              72.48               137.16 34.48  No Bid 

1 1/4" BRASS CAP 4  EA  No Bid  $           62.00  $          55.68  No Bid              55.20                 67.92 25.52  No Bid 

1" BRASS CAP 4  EA  No Bid  $           35.20  $          31.56  No Bid              31.32                 38.52 16.80  No Bid 

3/4" BRASS CAP 4  EA  No Bid  $           19.40  $          17.80  No Bid              17.28                 21.28 10.72  No Bid 

ITEM 23 - THREADED BRASS (DOMESTIC, no lead) CONTINUED
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2" BRASS TEE 4  EA  No Bid  $         225.00  $        201.16  No Bid            200.20               246.24 114.68  No Bid 

1 1/2" BRASS TEE 4  EA  No Bid  $         135.80  $        121.60  No Bid            120.80               148.60 69.96  No Bid 

1" BRASS TEE 4  EA  No Bid  $           70.00  $          62.56  No Bid              62.16                 76.20 36.28  No Bid 

3/4" BRASS TEE 4  EA  No Bid  $           38.00  $          34.76  No Bid              34.44                 42.36 20.44  No Bid 

 $                  -    $      4,259.84  $     2,284.92  $                -    $     3,737.14  $        4,639.28  $     2,344.80  $                -   

ITEM 24 - STAINLESS STEEL INSERTS

S.S. INSERT, FORD #55 2" CTS 12  EA  No Bid  $           75.00  No Bid  No Bid              18.24                 18.96 80.64  No Bid 

S.S. INSERT 1 1/2" CTS 6  EA  No Bid  $           21.60  No Bid  No Bid                9.12                   9.48 23.22  No Bid 

S.S. INSERT, FORD #52 1" CTS 12  EA  No Bid  $           22.08  No Bid  No Bid              13.20                 13.80 23.64  No Bid 

S.S. INSERT, FORD #51 3/4" CTS 8  EA  No Bid  $           13.60  No Bid  No Bid                8.24                   8.64 14.80  No Bid 

 $                  -    $         132.28  $                -    $                -    $          48.80  $             50.88  $        142.30  $                -   

ITEM 25 - NEPTUNE METERS

METERS, 5/8" x 3/4"PROREAD C/F 20  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            2,250.00  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 5/8" x 3/4"ECODER C/F 250  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid          32,197.50  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 5/8" x 3/4"ECODER C/F PIT  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, NEPTUNE 5/8" X 3/4" T-10 PROREAD PIT 12  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            1,636.44  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 3/4" TPA - T10 PROREAD C/F 6  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            1,109.10  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 3/4" TPA - T10 ECODER C/F 40  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            7,697.20  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 1" TPA - T10 PROREAD C/F 6  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            1,545.48  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 1" TPA - T10 ECODER C/F 24  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            6,363.84  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 1 1/2" T10 - ECODER FLANGED C/F 10  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            5,272.80  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 2" T10 - ECODER FLANGED C/F 10  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            6,575.80  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS,  2" NEPTUNE HPT TURBINE METER-ECODER 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            2,957.60  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 3" NEPTUNE HPT TURBINE METER-ECODER CU. FT.
2  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            2,257.58  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, 4" NEPTUNE HPT TURBINE METER-ECODER CU. FT.
1  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            1,500.00  No Bid  No Bid 

2" COMPOUND METER COMPLETE, C/F PIT ECODER 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            6,515.16  No Bid  No Bid 

ITEM 23 - THREADED BRASS (DOMESTIC, no lead) CONTINUED

Total Item 23 - THREADED BRASS

Total Item 24 - STAINLESS STEEL INSERTS
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ITEM 25 - NEPTUNE METERS CONTINUED

2" UME - UNITIZED MEASURING ELEMENT - COMPOUND 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            2,617.16  No Bid  No Bid 

3" COMPOUND METER COMPLETE, C/F PIT ECODER 2  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            4,848.50  No Bid  No Bid 

3" UME - UNITIZED MEASURING ELEMENT - COMPOUND 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            1,900.00  No Bid  No Bid 

4" COMPOUND METER COMPLETE, C/F PIT ECODER 2  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            6,296.98  No Bid  No Bid 

4" UME - UNITIZED MEASURING ELEMENT - COMPOUND 2  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            2,500.00  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, R900 WALL MIU ASSEMBLY - NEPTUNE 100  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid          10,715.00  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, R900 PIT MIU ASSEMBLY - NEPTUNE 20  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            2,571.60  No Bid  No Bid 

METERS, R900 REPLACEMENT BATTERY PACK 100  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            3,220.00  No Bid  No Bid 

CHAMBER COMP 5/8" T-10 9400-000 30  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               552.00  No Bid  No Bid 

CHAMBER COMP 3/4" T-10 9826-200 10  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               246.20  No Bid  No Bid 

CHAMBER COMP 1" T-10 9826-300 10  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               471.50  No Bid  No Bid 

METER WASHERS 5/8 x 3/4 1000  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        180.00               340.00  No Bid  No Bid 

METER WASHERS 3/4 100  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          18.00                 34.00  No Bid  No Bid 

METER WASHERS 1" 400  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          88.00               176.00  No Bid  No Bid 

METER WASHERS 1 1/2" 50  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          86.50               130.00  No Bid  No Bid 

METER WASHERS 2" 50  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        112.00               160.00  No Bid  No Bid 

METER WASHERS 3" 20  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        196.60                 71.20  No Bid  No Bid 

METER WASHERS 4" 20  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $        281.80                 84.80  No Bid  No Bid 

METER WASHERS 6" 4  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $          83.72                 30.92  No Bid  No Bid 

 $                  -    $                -    $                -    $                -    $     1,046.62  $    114,844.36  $                -    $                -   Total Item 25 - NEPTUNE METERS
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ITEM 26 - METER REGISTERS

ECODER REGISTERS 5/8" 30  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            2,785.80  No Bid  No Bid 

ECODER REGISTERS 3/4" 20  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            1,857.20  No Bid  No Bid 

ECODER REGISTERS 1" 10  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               928.60  No Bid  No Bid 

ECODER REGISTERS 1 1/2" 6  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               557.16  No Bid  No Bid 

ECODER REGISTERS 2" 6  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               557.16  No Bid  No Bid 

ECODER REGISTERS 3" 2  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               185.72  No Bid  No Bid 

ECODER REGISTERS 4" 2  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               185.72  No Bid  No Bid 

PROREAD REGISTERS 5/8" 15  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid            1,285.80  No Bid  No Bid 

PROREAD REGISTERS 3/4" 10  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               857.20  No Bid  No Bid 

PROREAD REGISTERS 1" 5  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               428.60  No Bid  No Bid 

PROREAD REGISTERS 1 1/2" 3  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               257.16  No Bid  No Bid 

PROREAD REGISTERS 2" 3  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid               257.16  No Bid  No Bid 

PROREAD REGISTERS 3" 1  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid                 85.72  No Bid  No Bid 

PROREAD REGISTERS 4" 1  EA  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid                 85.72  No Bid  No Bid 

 $                  -    $                -    $                -    $                -    $                -    $      10,314.72  $                -    $                -   Total Item 26 - METER REGISTERS


