Westford Water Department
Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

Easton

Waterline

DESCRIPTION Quantity Unit Ti-Sales Stiles HD Supply HR Prescott WinWater Supply Pipe Plus
ITEM 1-DUCTILE IRON PIPE
16" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 20 LF No Bid No Bid $ 1,09940|$% 1,014.00 No Bid No Bid $ 1,072.00
12" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 20 LF No Bid No Bid $ 761.20| $ 702.00 No Bid No Bid $ 742.20
10" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 20 LF No Bid No Bid $ 609.00| $ 562.00 No Bid No Bid $ 593.80
8" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 20 LF No Bid No Bid $ 461.00( $ 425.00 No Bid No Bid $ 449.40
6" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 200 LF No Bid No Bid $ 3,304.00] $ 2,960.00 No Bid No Bid $ 3,222.00
4" DUCTILE IRON PIPE 60 LF No Bid No Bid $ 113880 % 1,062.00 No Bid No Bid $ 1,110.60
Total Item 1 - DUCTILE IRON PIPE $ 737340 $ 6,725.00 $ 7,190.00
ITEM 2 - PVC PIPE
12" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 40 LF No Bid No Bid $ 648.80 | $ 670.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 40 LF No Bid No Bid $ 460.00( $ 470.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 100 LF No Bid No Bid $ 767.00| $ 775.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 200 LF No Bid No Bid $ 888.00( $ 950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" C-900- DR-18 PVC Pipe (Blue Brute) 60 LF No Bid No Bid $ 134.40( $ 135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 2 - PVC PIPE $ 28920 $ 3,000.00
ITEM 3 - PE TUBING
2" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 200 LF No Bid $ 240.00| $ 332.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 100 LF No Bid $ 79.00( $ 97.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 60 LF No Bid $ 40.20( $ 38.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 1000 LF No Bid $ 470.00| $ 460.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CTS POLYETHYLENE TUBING, 200PSI 300 LF No Bid $ 90.00( $ 87.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
SERVICE LINE SLEEVE, 4" ID HDPE ASTM F810 2000 LF No Bid No Bid $ 6,160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 3 - PE TUBING $ 919.20 $ 7,174.40
ITEM 4 - MJ VALVES
16" BUTTERFLY VALVE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 2271131 $ 3,800.00( $ 3,926.20 No Bid $ 2,315.00
12" MJ GATE VALVE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 152409|% 1,49500| $ 1530001 % 1,372.00] $ 1,430.00
10" MJ GATE VALVE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 121539| % 1,17500$ 1,209.13|1$ 1,079.00| $ 1,142.00
8" GATE VALVE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 785.11| $ 775.00| $ 77543 $ 703.00| $ 733.00
6" MJ GATE VALVE 8 No Bid No Bid $ 4,0329|$ 3,800.00(% 389478 % 3,296.00]% 3,680.00
4" MJ GATE VALVE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 397.06| $ 370.00| $ 381.52( $ 260.00( $ 360.00
Total Item 4 - MJ VALVES $ 10,225.74 $ 11,41500 $ 11,717.06 $ 6,710.00 $ 9,660.00




Westford Water Department

Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

Easton

Waterline

DESCRIPTION Quantity Ti-Sales Stiles HD Supply HR Prescott WinWater Supply Pipe Plus
ITEM5-MJFITTINGS (BENDS,SOLID SLEEVES, ETC)
Solid Sleeves
16" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 No Bid No Bid $ 1,84086|% 1,230.00 No Bid No Bid $ 518.00
12" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 No Bid No Bid $ 843.28( $ 490.00 No Bid No Bid $ 272.00
10" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 No Bid No Bid $ 630.12( $ 362.00 No Bid No Bid $ 200.00
8" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 No Bid No Bid $ 429541 $ 242.00 No Bid No Bid $ 170.00
6" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 No Bid No Bid $ 32534 $ 186.00 No Bid No Bid $ 104.00
4" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 No Bid No Bid $ 242241 $ 124.00 No Bid No Bid $ 64.00
Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Solid Sleeves $ 431138 $ 2,634.00 $ 1,328.00
Bends

16" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 2373401 % 1,780.00 No Bid No Bid $ 822.00
12" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 112572| % 780.00 No Bid No Bid $ 356.00
10" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 800.14( $ 540.00 No Bid No Bid $ 264.00
8" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 49558 | $ 310.00 No Bid No Bid $ 168.00
6" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 350.64| $ 212.00 No Bid No Bid $ 116.00
4" MJ BEND, 90 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 252.08| $ 134.00 No Bid No Bid $ 70.00
16" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 1975.76|$% 1,370.00 No Bid No Bid $ 580.00
12" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 969.74 | $ 620.00 No Bid No Bid $ 296.00
10" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 62450 $ 356.00 No Bid No Bid $ 198.00
8" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 435.16( $ 248.00 No Bid No Bid $ 136.00
6" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 31550( $ 174.00 No Bid No Bid $ 94.00
4" MJ BEND, 45 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 231.00| $ 112.00 No Bid No Bid $ 60.00
16" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 192236|$% 1,314.00 No Bid No Bid $ 554.00
12" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 878.42|( $ 524.00 No Bid No Bid $ 258.00
10" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 614.66 | $ 346.00 No Bid No Bid $ 196.00
8" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 42954 $ 240.00 No Bid No Bid $ 132.00
6" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 300.04( $ 158.00 No Bid No Bid $ 86.00
4" MJ BEND, 22 1/2 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 226.781 $ 108.00 No Bid No Bid $ 58.00
16" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 192236|% 1,320.00 No Bid No Bid $ 586.00
12" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 851.72( $ 498.00 No Bid No Bid $ 242.00
8" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 628.72| $ 222.00 No Bid No Bid $ 120.00
6" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 366.30| $ 164.00 No Bid No Bid $ 88.00
4" MJ BEND, 11 1/4 DEG. 2 No Bid No Bid $ 304.26| $ 96.00 No Bid No Bid $ 54.00
Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Bends $ 18,394.38 $ 11,626.00 $ 5,534.00




Westford Water Department
Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

Easton

Waterline

DESCRIPTION Quantity Unit Ti-Sales Stiles HD Supply HR Prescott WinWater Supply Pipe Plus
Reducers
16" x 12" MJ REDUCER 2 No Bid No Bid $ 1,39056]| $ 910.00 No Bid No Bid $ 384.00
12" X 8" MJ REDUCER 2 No Bid No Bid $ 667.34| $ 398.00 No Bid No Bid $ 170.00
12" X 6" MJ REDUCER 2 No Bid No Bid $ 634.20 $ 390.00 No Bid No Bid $ 164.00
12" X 4" MJ REDUCER 2 No Bid No Bid $ 639.02( $ 408.00 No Bid No Bid $ 190.00
8" X 6" MJ REDUCER 2 No Bid No Bid $ 368.30| $ 204.00 No Bid No Bid $ 96.00
8" X 4" MJ REDUCER 2 No Bid No Bid $ 34220 $ 190.00 No Bid No Bid $ 92.00
6" X 4" MJ REDUCER 2 No Bid No Bid $ 252.88| $ 124.00 No Bid No Bid $ 68.00
Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Reducers $ 429450 $ 2,624.00 $ - $ 1,164.00
Tees
12" X 12" X 12" MJ TEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 763.14| $ 505.00 No Bid No Bid $ 248.00
12" X 12" X 10" MJ TEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 718.63| $ 480.00 No Bid No Bid $ 249.00
12" X 12" X 8" MJ TEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 602.10( $ 380.00 No Bid No Bid $ 194.00
12" X 12" X 6" MJ TEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 570.07( $ 360.00 No Bid No Bid $ 167.00
12" X 12" X 6" MJ SWIVEL TEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 588.73 | $ 405.00 No Bid No Bid $ 172.00
10" X 10" X 6" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 489.87( $ 346.00 No Bid No Bid $ 152.00
8" X 8" X 8"MJTEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 367.12( $ 228.00 No Bid No Bid $ 124.00
8" X 8" X 6" MJTEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 319.64( $ 192.00 No Bid No Bid $ 103.00
8" X 8" X 4"MJTEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 281301 $ 158.00 No Bid No Bid $ 89.00
8" X 6" SWIVEL TEE 4 No Bid No Bid $ 1,305.36| $ 880.00 No Bid No Bid $ 120.00
6" X 6" X6"MJTEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 257.70| $ 153.00 No Bid No Bid $ 83.00
6" X 6" X 4" MJTEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 236.22| $ 137.00 No Bid No Bid $ 77.00
6" X 6" MJ SWIVEL TEE 3 No Bid No Bid $ 778471 $ 528.00 No Bid No Bid $ 288.00
4" MJ TEE 1 No Bid No Bid $ 178.52| $ 90.00 No Bid No Bid $ 46.00
Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Tees $ 745687 $ 484200 $ - $ 2112.00
Plugs
16" MJ PLUG 1 No Bid No Bid $ 515.69| $ 495.00 No Bid No Bid $ 208.00
12" MJ PLUG 1 No Bid No Bid $ 158.97| $ 139.00 No Bid No Bid $ 79.00
8" MJ PLUG 1 No Bid No Bid $ 104.61| $ 90.00 No Bid No Bid $ 46.00
6" MJ PLUG 1 No Bid No Bid $ 77.16| $ 64.00 No Bid No Bid $ 31.00
4" MJ PLUG 1 No Bid No Bid $ 51.77| $ 40.00 No Bid No Bid $ 16.00
Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Reducers $ 908.20 $ 828.00 $ - $ 380.00




Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

Westford Water Department

. . . . Easton Waterline .
DESCRIPTION Quantity Unit Ti-Sales Stiles HD Supply HR Prescott WinWater Supply Pipe Plus
Caps
16" MJ CAP 1 No Bid No Bid $ 493.59 345.00 No Bid No Bid $ 145.00
12" MJ CAP 1 No Bid No Bid $ 212.23 125.00 No Bid No Bid $ 72.00
8" MJ CAP 1 No Bid No Bid $ 113.01 66.00 No Bid No Bid $ 38.00
6" MJ CAP 1 No Bid No Bid $ 77.47 43.00 No Bid No Bid $ 24.00
4" MJ CAP 1 No Bid No Bid $ 60.92 32.00 No Bid No Bid $ 13.00
Subtotal Item 5 - MJ Fittings Reducers $ 957.22 $ 611.00 $ $ 292.00
Total Item 5 - MJ FITTINGS $ 36,32255 $ 23,165.00 $ $ - $ 10,810.00




Westford Water Department
Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

Easton

Waterline

DESCRIPTION Quantity Unit Ti-Sales Stiles HD Supply HR Prescott WinWater Supply Pipe Plus
ITEM 6 - RETAINER GLANDS
16" MEGA-LUG MJ WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 4 No Bid No Bid $ 653.52| $ 676.00| $ 635.94 No Bid $ 676.00
12" MEGA-LUG MJ WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 4 No Bid No Bid $ 371.16( $ 396.00| $ 357.74 No Bid $ 396.00
10" MEGA-LUG MJ WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 4 No Bid No Bid $ 280.24| $ 296.00| $ 257.25 No Bid $ 296.00
8" MEGA-LUG MJ WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 6 No Bid No Bid $ 294421 $ 312.00| $ 266.37 No Bid $ 312.00
6" MEGA-LUG MJ WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 8 No Bid No Bid $ 293.76| $ 304.00| $ 250.64 No Bid $ 304.00
4" MEGA-LUG MJ WITH/ACCESORY PACK CI/DI 4 No Bid No Bid $ 12280 $ 124.00( $ 104.85 No Bid $ 124.00
12" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 4 No Bid No Bid $ 406.88( $ 436.00| $ 397.74 No Bid $ 436.00
10" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 4 No Bid No Bid $ 386.08( $ 416.00| $ 375.83 No Bid $ 412.00
8" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 6 No Bid No Bid $ 337.26 | $ 360.00| $ 314.32 No Bid $ 360.00
6" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 8 No Bid No Bid $ 33752 $ 360.00| $ 299.65 No Bid $ 360.00
4" GRIP RING MJ WITH ACCESSORY PACK C-900 PVC 4 No Bid No Bid $ 138.84| $ 140.00( $ 122.80 No Bid $ 144.00
Total Item 6 - RETAINER GLANDS $ 362248 $ 382000 $ 3,383.13 $ - $ 3,820.00
ITEM 7 - GATE BOXES AND RISERS
GATE BOX COVER 60 No Bid No Bid $ 77940 $ 945.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
LOCKING GATE BOX COVER 10 No Bid No Bid $ 22780 $ 420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GATE BOX COMPLETE, 48" BOTTOM, 26" TOP W/COVER 25 No Bid No Bid $ 3274501 % 4,625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GATE BOX TOP, 26" W/ COVER 20 No Bid No Bid $ 1,236.60| % 1,640.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GATE BOX BOTTOM, 48" 20 No Bid No Bid $ 1,383.00| % 2,080.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GATE BOX RISER, 1" 60 No Bid No Bid $ 1303.80|¢% 1,197.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GATE BOX RISER, 1 1/2" 60 No Bid No Bid $ 1,440.60|$ 1,440.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GATE BOX RISER, 2" 30 No Bid No Bid $ 754.80| $ 817.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GATE BOX RISER, 4" 10 No Bid No Bid $ 297201 $ 420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
GATE BOX RISER, 12" ADJUSTABLE (Rise Rite style) 6 No Bid No Bid $ 240.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GATE BOX RISER, 18" ADJUSTABLE (Rise Rite style) 6 No Bid No Bid $ 260.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 7 - GATE BOXES AND RISERS $ 11,19858 $ 13,584.50




Westford Water Department
Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

Easton

Waterline

DESCRIPTION Quantity Unit Ti-Sales Stiles HD Supply HR Prescott WinWater Supply Pipe Plus

ITEM 8 - SERVICE SADDLES

16"X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 141.87( $ 131.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16" X 1.5" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 14187 $ 131.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16" X 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 132.17( $ 123.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
16" X 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 132.17( $ 123.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 87.92( $ 86.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" X 1.5" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 87.92( $ 86.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12"X 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 2 $ 171.80( $ 168.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12"X 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE -STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 85.90( $ 84.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE-STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 79.59| $ 77.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" X 1.5" CC SERVICE SADDLE-STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 79.59( $ 77.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" x 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 7522 $ 72.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" x 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 7522 $ 72.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 6747 $ 64.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" X 1.5" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 67.47| $ 64.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" X 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 6 $ 379.20| $ 357.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" X 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 2 $ 126.40( $ 119.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 56.32| $ 52.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" X 11/2" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 56.32| $ 52.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" X 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 10 $ 52350| $ 479.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" X 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE - STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 2 $ 104.70( $ 95.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" X 2" CC SERVICE SADDLE- STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 5462 $ 51.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" X 11/2" CC SERVICE SADDLE- STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 5462 $ 51.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" X 1" CC SERVICE SADDLE- STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 3 $ 154.80( $ 138.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" X 3/4" CC SERVICE SADDLE- STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 5160 $ 46.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 1" IP SERVICE SADDLE WITH STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 40.74| $ 35.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 3/4" IP SERVICE SADDLE WITH STAINLESS STEEL BANDS 1 $ 40.74| $ 35.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 8 - SERVICE SADDLES $ 3,069.74 $ 2,880.63




Westford Water Department
Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

Easton

Waterline

DESCRIPTION Quantity Unit Ti-Sales Stiles HD Supply HR Prescott WinWater Supply Pipe Plus
ITEM 9 - REPAIR COUPLINGS
16" REPAIR COUPLING - HYMAX 2 No Bid No Bid $ 1,660.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" DUCTILE IRON REPAIR COUPLINGS - HYMAX 2 No Bid No Bid $ 618.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY
COATED/EXTENDED RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 2 No Bid No Bid 3 618.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" DUCTILE IRON REPAIR COUPLINGS - HYMAX 2 No Bid No Bid 523.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY
COATED/EXTENDED RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 2 No Bid No Bid 523.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" DUCTILE IRON COUPLING - HYMAX 4 No Bid No Bid 814.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY
COATED/EXTENDED RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 4 No Bid No Bid 814.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" DUCTILE IRON COUPLING - HYMAX 4 No Bid No Bid 721.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY
COATED/EXTENDED RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 4 No Bid No Bid 721.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" DUCTILE IRON COUPLING - HYMAX 2 No Bid No Bid 721.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" DUCTILE IRON, RPR COUPLING, EPOXY
COATED/EXTENDED RANGE (Romac Macro HP or equal) 2 No Bid No Bid 272.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 9 - REPAIR COUPLINGS $ 8,007.28
ITEM 10 - WRAP-AROUND REPAIR CLAMPS
16" STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP DOUBLE BAND 12.5"
LONG 1 $ 276.97| $ 284.65 No Bid $ 515.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
16" STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP DOUBLE BAND 15"
LONG 1 $ 308.08| $ 301.20 No Bid $ 545.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 1 $ 153.98( $ 129.34 No Bid $ 248.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 1 $ 174.06( $ 160.83 No Bid $ 268.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 1 $ 136.65( $ 126.25 No Bid $ 205.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 1 $ 157.23| $ 145.27 No Bid $ 235.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 4 $ 405.20( $ 374.36 No Bid $ 628.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 4 $ 463.20| $ 427.96 No Bid $ 716.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 4 $ 344.60| $ 318.36 No Bid $ 540.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 4 $ 381.12| $ 352.12 No Bid $ 588.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 12.5" WIDE 2 $ 143.34( $ 132.44 No Bid $ 220.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE 2 $ 155.92 144.04 No Bid $ 246.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 10 - WRAP-AROUND REPAIR CLAMPS $ 3,100.35 $ 2,896.82 $ 4,954.00




Westford Water Department
Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

Easton

Waterline

DESCRIPTION Quantity Unit Ti-Sales Stiles HD Supply HR Prescott WinWater Supply Pipe Plus
ITEM 11 - WRAP-AROUND REPAIR CLAMPS WITH TAP
12" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2"
CCTAP 1 $ 218.80| $ 202.16 No Bid 340.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1"
CCTAP 1 $ 198.31( $ 184.00 No Bid 320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2"
CCTAP 1 $ 197.14| $ 183.00 No Bid 305.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1"
CCTAP 1 $ 182.16| $ 168.00 No Bid 285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2"
CCTAP 1 $ 155.71 $ 143.00 No Bid 247.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1"
CCTAP 1 $ 140.72| $ 130.00 No Bid 226.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2"
CCTAP 1 $ 135.18| $ 124.90 No Bid 212.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1"
CCTAP 1 $ 120.21| $ 111.00 No Bid 192.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 2"
CCTAP 1 $ 117.86( $ 108.00 No Bid 188.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" ALL STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMP - 15" WIDE WITH 1"
CC TAP 1 $ 102.89| $ 97.00 No Bid 166.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 11 - WRAP-AROUND REPAIR CLAMPS WITH TAP $1,568.98 $1,451.06 $2,481.00
ITEM 12 - CORPORATION STOPS (Ball Corp, Quick Joint, no
lead)
2" CORPORATION, CC X CTQJ 2 $ 361.48| $ 354.18| $ 367.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" CORPORATION, CC X CTQJ 2 $ 218.58| $ 214.16| $ 222.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CORPORATION, CC X CTQJ 24 $ 1,170.481 $ 1,146.72 $ 1,180.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CORPORATION, CC X CTQJ 24 $ 889.92| $ 87192 $ 897.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 12 - CORPORATION STOPS $ 264046 $ 258698 $ 2,667.72
ITEM 13 - CURB STOPS (Ball Curb, Quick Joint, no lead)
2" CURB STOP, FIP X FIP 2 $ 367.16| $ 359.74]1 $ 385.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" CURB STOP, CTQJ X CTQJ 2 $ 513.40| $ 503.02| $ 539.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" BALL CURB VALVE, CTQJ X CTQJ 2 $ 365.18| $ 357.80| $ 362.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" BALL CURB VALVE, FIP X FIP 2 $ 251.06| $ 246.00| $ 263.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" BALL CURB VALVE, CTQJ X CTQJ 24 $ 1831441 $ 1,794.24( $ 1911.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" BALL CURB VALVE, FIP X FIP 6 $ 367.86| $ 360.42| $ 383.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" BALL CURB VALVE, CTQJ X CTQJ 24 $ 1,218.001 $ 1,193.28] $ 1,271.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" BALL CURB VALVE, FIP X FIP 6 $ 236.64| $ 231.84| $ 246.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 13 - CURB STOPS $ 5,150.74 $ 5,046.34 $ 5,364.22
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ITEM 14 - MALE ADAPTERS (Quick Joint, no lead)
2" CTQJ X MIP 4 $ 217.28| $ 212.88| $ 225.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" CTQJ X MIP 2 $ 7456 $ 73.04( $ 77.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CTQJ X MIP 10 $ 136.10( $ 133.30( $ 139.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CTQJ X 3/4" MIP 6 $ 76.38 $ 74.82| $ 73.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CTQJ X 1" MIP 6 $ 75.36| $ 73.80( $ 77.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CTQJ X MIP 10 $ 114.90( $ 112.60( $ 118.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 14 - MALE ADAPTERS $ 694.58 $ 680.44 $ 712.12
ITEM 15 - FEMALE ADAPTERS (Quick Joint, no lead)
2" CTQJ X FIP 4 $ 227.12| $ 222.48| $ 235.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" CTQJ X FIP 2 $ 95.38( $ 93.44| $ 98.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CTQJ X FIP 10 $ 164.10( $ 160.70( $ 181.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CTQJ X 3/4" FIP 6 $ 85.44] $ 80.70| $ 88.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CTQJI X 1" FIP 6 $ 86.40| $ 84.60( $ 88.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CTQJ X FIP 10 $ 120.90( $ 118.40( $ 126.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 15 - FEMALE ADAPTERS $ 779.34 $ 760.32 $ 820.32
ITEM 16 - 3 PART UNIONS (Quick Joint, no lead)
2" CTQJ BRASS UNION CTQJ X CTQJ 4 $ 289.24] $ 283.36| $ 300.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" 3PART UNION CTQJ X CTQJ 4 $ 214.24| $ 209.88| $ 222.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" 3 PART UNION CTQJ X CTQJ 24 $ 384.48| $ 376.56| $ 378.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CTQJI X 3/4" CTQJ 10 $ 162.70| $ 159.30( $ 159.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" 3 PART UNION CTQJ X CTQJ 10 $ 139.90| $ 137.10| $ 144.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 16 - 3 PART UNIONS $ 1,19056 $ 1,166.20 $ 1,204.98
ITEM 17 - COMPRESSION BENDS (Quick Joint, no lead)
1" 90 DEG. BEND CTQJ X CTQJ 6 $ 139.38| $ 136.56| $ 136.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" 90 DEG. BEND CTQJ X CTQJ 6 $ 108.54| $ 106.32| $ 106.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 17 - COMPRESSION BENDS $ 24792 $ 24288 $ 243.36
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ITEM 18 - CURB BOXES
BUFFALO STYLE CURB BOX WITH COVER(48" bottom, 24" top) 60 $ 3,726.00 No Bid $ 3,328.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BUFFALO STYLE CURB BOX EXTENSION 9" 30 $ 318.90 No Bid $ 492.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BUFFALO STYLE CURB BOX EXTENSION 16" 16 $ 270.08 No Bid 3 298.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BUFFALO STYLE CURB BOX COVER 12 $ 54.24 No Bid $ 57.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" CENTERING ROD FOR BUFFALO STYLE BOX 100 $ 2,102.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 18 - CURB BOXES $ 6,471.22 $ - $ 4,177.10
ITEM 19 - METER VALVES (no lead)
2" BALL VALVE, FLANGE X FIP w/handle 12 $ 2,621.76| $ 2,840.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" BALL VALVE, FLANGE X FIP w/handle 8 $ 1,120.24| $ 1,169.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" BALL VALVE, FIP X FIP W/ HANDLE 20 $ 1,326.401 $ 1,267.80( $ 1,402.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" BALL VALVE WITH HANDLE, CTQJ X 3/4" meter swivel 20 $ 1,469.001 $ 1,185.80( $ 1,334.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" 90 DEGREE BALL VALVE CTQJ X 3/4" meter swivel 50 $ 3,301.50| $ 3,401.00] $ 3,442.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CELLAR VALVE W/ HANDLE, FIP X FIP 10 $ 428.40| $ 43550] $ 122.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CELLAR VALVE W/ HANDLE, CTQJ X 3/4" meter swivel 20 $ 1,125.00( $ 1,174.00( $ 831.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" 90 DEGREE BALL VALVE CTQJ X 3/4™ meter swivel 50 $ 2,90850| $ 3,016.00f $ 3,260.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" FIP X 3/4" meter swivel 20 $ 1,125.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 19 - METER VALVES $ 1542580 $ 14,490.10 $ 10,393.20
ITEM 20 - METER FLANGES (No lead)
2" BRONZE METER FLANGE X 2" FIP 4 $ 173.48| $ 169.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" BRONZE METER FLANGE X 1 1/2" FIP 4 $ 132.88( $ 130.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER ADAPTOR, 2" FLANGE X 1" METER NUT 4 $ 453.72| $ 44452 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER ADAPTOR, 1 1/2" FLANGE X 1" METER NUT 4 $ 443.28| $ 434.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 20 - METER FLANGES $ 1,203.36 $ 1,179.00
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ITEM 21 - METER SET FITTINGS (No lead)
1" CHECK VALVE FIP X FIP 40 No Bid $ 940.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CHECK VALVE 1" FIP x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (straight) 60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CHECK VALVE 3/4" FIP x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (straight) 60 No Bid $ 2,841.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CHECK VALVE 1" FIP x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (90 degree) 40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" CHECK VALVE 3/4" FIP x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (90 degree) 40 No Bid $ 1,894.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" MIP x 5/8" x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (1" METER SPUD) 40 No Bid $ 476.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" MIP x 5/8" x 3/4" METER SWIVEL (3/4" METER SPUD) 40 No Bid $ 292.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 21 - METER SET FITTINGS $ 6,444.20
ITEM 22 - BRASS WELL ADAPTERS (No lead)
1" MIP X 1" BARB 6 No Bid $ 62.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" BARB X 3/4" MIP 6 No Bid $ 53.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" FIP X 3/4" BARB 6 No Bid $ 56.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" FIP X 3/4" BARB 6 No Bid $ 57.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 22 - BRASS WELL ADAPTERS $ 229.14
ITEM 23 - HYDRANTS
HYDRANT, 6'BURY (Clow or Mueller w/Yellow Body, white caps &
bonnet) Open Left 1 $ 1,714.65 No Bid $ 1821.19|$ 1,765.00($ 1,825.71|$ 1,670.00 1,730.00
HYDRANT, 5 1/2' BURY (Clow or Mueller w/Yellow Body, white caps
& bonnet) Open Left 6 $ 10,069.32 No Bid $ 10,695.36| $ 10,350.00| $ 10,721.41( $ 9,900.00 10,140.00
HYDRANT, 5 BURY (Clow or Mueller w/Yellow Body, white caps &
bonnet) Open Left 1 $ 1,641.79 No Bid 1,743.91 1,695.00 1,748101 $ 1,627.00 1,650.00
Eclipse #2 Hydrant OL with 2" IP Inlet, 5' - 6" Bury 2 $ 1,817.86 No Bid 2,053.34 1,990.00 1,680.43 No Bid 2,200.00
Total Item 23 - HYDRANTS $ 15,243.62 $ 16,313.80 15,800.00 $ 15,975.65 $ 13,197.00 15,720.00
ITEM 24 - HYDRANT EXTENSION KITS
HYDT. EXTENSION KIT, 12" MUELLER 4 No Bid No Bid $ 1,629.88 No Bid $ 181017] $ 896.00 No Bid
HYDT. EXTENSION KIT, 12" CLOW 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 158000 $ 1,180.17 No Bid No Bid
HYDT. EXTENSION KIT, 6" MUELLER 6 No Bid No Bid $ 2,077.80 No Bid $ 149791 $ 1,152.00 No Bid
HYDT. EXTENSION KIT, 6" CLOW 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2,01000| $ 149791 No Bid No Bid
Total Item 24 - HYDRANT EXTENSION KITS $ 370768 $ 3590.00 $ 5986.16 $ 2,048.00
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ITEM 25 - HYDRANT REPAIR KITS
HYDRANT REPAIR KIT - MUELLER 4 1/2" 6 No Bid No Bid $ 825.42 No Bid $ 675.20 No Bid No Bid
HYDRANT REPAIR KIT - MUELLER 5 1/4" 6 No Bid No Bid $ 825.42 No Bid $ 714.91 672.00 No Bid
HYDRANT REPAIR KIT - CLOW 5 1/4" 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,560.00( $ 1,191.52 No Bid No Bid
Total Item 25 - HYDRANT EXTENSION KITS $ 1,650.84 1,560.00 $ 2,581.63 672.00
ITEM 26 - THREADED BRASS (DOMESTIC, no lead)
2" BRASS IP, 90 DEG. BEND 4 $ 178.20( $ 143.40( $ 77.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" BRASS IP, 45 DEG. BEND 4 $ 244.28| $ 196.64| $ 85.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" BRASS IP, 90 DEG. BEND 4 $ 110.40| $ 88.84] $ 66.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" BRASS IP, 45 DEG. BEND 4 $ 171.441 $ 12156 $ 52.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" BRASS IP, 90 DEG. BEND 4 $ 55.20( $ 44.40( $ 24.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" BRASS IP, 90 DEG. BEND 4 $ 33.96( $ 27.28| $ 15.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 92.80( $ 79.40( $ 74.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 4" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 71.28( $ 53.76| $ 50.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 54.48| $ 41.08| $ 38.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 43.72| $ 32,96 $ 31.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 8184 $ 61.76| $ 58.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" X 4" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 51.00( $ 41.80( $ 39.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 4252 $ 32.08( $ 30.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" X 2" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 30.88| $ 23.28( $ 21.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 2640 $ 21.64( $ 20.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 41.04( $ 35.08( $ 33.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" X 4" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 3160 $ 23.80( $ 22.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 2428 $ 18.28] $ 17.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" X 2" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 18.08]| $ 13.60| $ 12.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 1464 $ 11.04] $ 10.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" X 6" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 3184 $ 24.00( $ 22.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" X 4" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 21.80| $ 16.44| $ 15.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" X 3" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 16.76| $ 12.60| $ 11.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" X 2" BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 1252 $ 9.40| $ 8.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE 4 $ 9.96| $ 7.48| $ 7.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 182.52| $ 146.92| $ 66.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 11/2" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 97.68| $ 190.52| $ 76.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Westford Water Department
Water Distribution Supplies and Materials Bid Results

Easton

Waterline

DESCRIPTION Quantity Unit Ti-Sales Stiles HD Supply HR Prescott WinWater Supply Pipe Plus
ITEM 26 - THREADED BRASS (DOMESTIC, no lead) CONTINUED
2" X 1" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 255.64| $ 205.76| $ 86.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 3/4" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 255.64| $ 205.76| $ 86.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 110.40( $ 88.84( $ 40.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" X 1" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 146.12( $ 117.60( $ 51.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" X 3/4" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 165.20| $ 132.96| $ 57.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 50.88( $ 40.92] $ 19.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" X 3/4" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 57.60( $ 46.32| $ 25.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" BRASS COUPLING 4 $ 2984 $ 23.96( $ 12.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 11/2" BRASS BUSHING 4 $ 92.96| $ 74.80| $ 40.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 1" BRASS BUSHING 4 $ 92.96( $ 74.80| $ 49.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" X 3/4"" BRASS BUSHING 4 $ 93.00( $ 7480 $ 49.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" X 1" BRASS BUSHING 4 $ 7532 $ 60.64| $ 27.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" X 3/4" BRASS BUSHING 4 $ 7532 $ 60.64| $ 33.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" X 3/4" BRASS BUSHING 4 $ 31.12] $ 60.64| $ 12.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2"PLUG, IP 4 $ 97.56| $ 78.48( $ 35.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" PLUG, IP 4 $ 50.44| $ 4784 $ 22.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/4" PLUG, IP 4 $ 2288 $ 38.32| $ 17.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" PLUG, IP 4 $ 3412 $ 27.28| $ 12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" CAPS 4 $ 3852] $ 30.12| $ 15.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" PLUG, CC 4 $ 45.12| $ 43.96] $ 42.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" PLUG, IP 4 $ 21.28( $ 17.08] $ 9.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" PLUG, CC 4 $ 31.00( $ 39.60( $ 40.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" BRASS CAP 4 $ 152.80| $ 122.96| $ 54.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" BRASS CAP 4 $ 148.00( $ 7172 $ 32.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/4" BRASS CAP 4 $ 67.92( $ 54.64( $ 23.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" BRASS CAP 4 $ 3852 $ 30.12( $ 15.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" BRASS CAP 4 $ 21.28( $ 17.08] $ 10.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM 26 - THREADED BRASS (DOMESTIC, no lead) CONTINUE
2" BRASS TEE 4 246.24| $ 198.12| $ 107.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" BRASS TEE 4 148.60| $ 119.92( $ 65.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" BRASS TEE 4 76.20| $ 6152 $ 34.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" BRASS TEE 4 42.36| $ 34.08( $ 19.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 26 - THREADED BRASS $ 461496 $ 382032 $ 2,144.36
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ITEM 27 - STAINLESS STEEL INSERTS
S.S. INSERT, FORD #55 2" CTS 12 $ 21.96| $ 18.60 66.36| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.S. INSERT 1 1/2" CTS 6 $ 10.98| $ 9.30 19.14|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.S. INSERT, FORD #52 1" CTS 12 $ 15.96| $ 13.56 19.56|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.S. INSERT, FORD #51 3/4" CTS 8 $ 10.00( $ 8.56 12.16| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 27 - STAINLESS STEEL INSERTS $ 58.90 $ 5002 $  117.22

*

ITEM 28 - NEPTUNE METERS
METERS, 5/8" x 3/4"PROREAD C/F 20 2,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 5/8" x 3/4"ECODER C/F 250 32,197.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 5/8" x 3/4"ECODER C/F PIT
METERS, NEPTUNE 5/8" X 3/4" T-10 PROREAD PIT 12 1,636.44  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 3/4" TPA - T10 PROREAD C/F 6 1,109.10f  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 3/4" TPA - T10 ECODER C/F 40 7,697.20|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 1" TPA - T10 PROREAD C/F 6 1,545.48(  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 1" TPA - T10 ECODER C/F 24 6,363.84|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 1 1/2" T10 - ECODER FLANGED C/F 10 5,272.80|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 2" T10 - ECODER FLANGED C/F 10 6,575.80|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 2" NEPTUNE HPT TURBINE METER-ECODER 4 2,957.60|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 3" NEPTUNE HPT TURBINE METER-ECODER CU. FT. ) 225758 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, 4" NEPTUNE HPT TURBINE METER-ECODER CU. FT. 1 150000|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2" COMPOUND METER COMPLETE, C/F PIT ECODER 4 6,515.16|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM 28 - NEPTUNE METERS CONTINUED

2" UME - UNITIZED MEASURING ELEMENT - COMPOUND 4 $  2,617.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3" COMPOUND METER COMPLETE, C/F PIT ECODER 2 $ 484850 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3" UME - UNITIZED MEASURING ELEMENT - COMPOUND 4 $  1,900.00( NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" COMPOUND METER COMPLETE, C/F PIT ECODER 2 $ 629698 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4" UME - UNITIZED MEASURING ELEMENT - COMPOUND 2 $  2,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, R900 WALL MIU ASSEMBLY - NEPTUNE 100 $ 10,715.00f NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, R900 PIT MIU ASSEMBLY - NEPTUNE 20 $ 257100 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METERS, R900 REPLACEMENT BATTERY PACK 100 $ 322000 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CHAMBER COMP 5/8" T-10 9400-000 30 $ 552.00| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CHAMBER COMP 3/4" T-10 9826-200 10 $ 246.20  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CHAMBER COMP 1" T-10 9826-300 10 $ 47150  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER WASHERS 5/8 x 3/4 1000 $ 340.00| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER WASHERS 3/4 100 $ 3400 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER WASHERS 1" 400 $ 176.00 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER WASHERS 1 1/2" 50 $ 130.00/ NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER WASHERS 2" 50 $ 160.00/ NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER WASHERS 3" 20 $ 71.20|  NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER WASHERS 4" 20 $ 84.80|  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
METER WASHERS 6" 4 $ 30.92| NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 28 - NEPTUNE METERS $ 114,843.26
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ITEM 29 - METER REGISTERS

ECODER REGISTERS 5/8" 30 $ 2,785.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ECODER REGISTERS 3/4" 20 $ 1,857.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ECODER REGISTERS 1" 10 $ 928.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ECODER REGISTERS 1 1/2" 6 $ 557.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ECODER REGISTERS 2" 6 $ 557.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ECODER REGISTERS 3" 2 $ 185.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ECODER REGISTERS 4" 2 $ 185.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROREAD REGISTERS 5/8" 15 $ 1,285.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROREAD REGISTERS 3/4" 10 $ 857.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROREAD REGISTERS 1" 5 $ 428.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROREAD REGISTERS 1 1/2" 3 $ 257.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROREAD REGISTERS 2" 3 $ 257.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROREAD REGISTERS 3" 1 $ 85.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PROREAD REGISTERS 4" 1 $ 85.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Item 29 - METER REGISTERS $ 10,314.72




